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Two recent events have further elucidated the strategies of the state vis-a-vis 
the black community and, more especially, the black section of the working 
class, first analysed in 'Race, class and the state' over a year ago. One is the 
House of Commons Select Committee Report on the West Indian Community 
and the other is the 10-month-old strike of Asian workers at the Grunwick 
Film Processing plant in Willesden in North London. Of these, the Grunwick 
issue is the more complex and confusing and, if only for those reasons, the 
more challenging of analysis - however risky the exercise of writing history 
even as it is being made. 

Grunwick processes photographic films and relies a great deal on the mail-
order business. It is estimated that around 90 per cent of those on the 
processing side are Asians, many of them women and most of them from 
East Africa. The strikers first walked out when a worker was sacked after 
being forced to do a job he could not possibly do in the time alloted for it. 
This was typical of the punitive, racist and degrading way in which the 
management treated the workforce. The strikers, on the advice of the local 
trades council, joined APEX (the Association of Professional Executive 
Clerical and Computer Staff). The employers, however, refused to recognise 
the union and the strike has now centred on the question of union recognition 
by management - since union recognition is a prerequisite to raising the 
wages from the exceptionally low figure of £25 for a 35-hour week. 

The strike has received widespread union support, which is in certain 
respects unique in the history of British trade unionism. Not only has full strike 
pay from APEX been forthcoming from the very beginning, but also other 
national unions, e.g. Transport and General Workers Union, the Union of Post 
Office Workers (UPW), the Trades Union Congress (TUC), and through their 
encouragement hundreds of local union branches, shop stewards 
committees, trades councils and others, have given financial and other 
support. Not only did Len Murray, General Secretary of the TUC, intervene 
personally in the dispute, but cabinet ministers have themselves been to the 
picket lines to give their support. After a certain amount of pressure, the UPW 
took the almost unprecendented step of introducing a postal ban. Although 
this lasted only four days in the event, it hit management hard since it relies 
on the mail-order side for 60 per cent of its business. 

At first it looked as though Grunwick was to be the rallying point for the labour 
movement to prove its commitment to black workers. But what is more 
apparent now is that the unions have been carefully determining the direction 
that the strike should take and the type of actions open to the strikers. It is 
worth recalling here the comments of George Bromley, a union negotiator for 
30 years with London Transport, who in 1974, during the Imperial Typewriters 
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strike of Asian workers, said, 'The workers have not followed the proper 
dispute procedures. They have no legitimate grievances and it's difficult to 
know what they want... Some people must learn how things are done'. 

The 'proper procedures' have in this case certainly been taught - and 
followed to the bureaucratic letter. When the right-wing National Association 
For Freedom threatened legal action against the postal boycott[1], the UPW 
capitulated, arguing to the strikers that they had persuaded management to 
go to arbitration to the Advisory Conciliation and Arbitration Service (ACAS). 
But when ACAS called for a ballot of the workforce, management sought to 
limit it to those still at work and not the strikers - so discrediting the ACAS 
procedure and the Employment Protection Act within which it operates. 
Similar bureaucratic procedures, such as appeals to the Industrial Tribunal 
and recourse to government investigation, have proved equally futile - and, 
worse, delayed the possibility of effective solidarity action. It was six months 
before ACAS's report (in favour of the strikers) finally came out. Nor has the 
UPW reintroduced its ban, despite its promise to do so once the report was 
out. 

�On the other hand, the unions have induced the strikers to stay out by almost 
doubling their strike pay. But while the unions are keen to keep the strike 
going at all costs, the strikers themselves have begun to question the conduct 
and purpose of' the unions' support. According to Mrs Desai, treasurer of the 
strike committee, `If the TUC wanted, this strike could be won tomorrow.' The 
workers are belatedly resorting to tactics they urged in the first place, such as 
picketing local chemists shops (from which Grunwick's trade also comes) and 
organising 24-hour pickets. 

Asian workers have over the last two decades proved to be one of the most 
militant sections of the working class. In strike after strike - Woolf's, Perivale 
Gutermann, Mansfield Hosiery, Imperial Typewriters, Harwood Cash and 
others - they have not only taken on the employers and sometimes won 
(limited) victories, but have also battled against racist trade unions which have 
either dragged their feet or quite often denied them the support they would 
have afforded white workers. The Imperial Typewriters case was the most 
blatant. In May 1974 Asians at Imperial Typewriters (a subsidairy of Litton 
Industries) went on strike over differentials between white and Asian workers. 
The unions refused their support and the strikers, supported by other black 
workers, had to fight both union and management (bolstered by the extreme 
right-wing party, the National Front). 

Over the Grunwick dispute, however, the unions have been unusually 
supportive of the Asian workforce. Some commentators on the left have 
traced the union change of direction to a sudden change of heart: it had 
come upon them (the unions) that racism was a bad thing and should be 
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outlawed from within their ranks. But why this 'change of heart'? 

In the first instance, of course, the basis of the Grunwick dispute is the 
unionisation of the workforce and it is therefore in the interests of the unions 
(and indeed their business) to recruit workers into their organisations. This is 
the most obvious reason for union support of the strike. But the inordinate 
anxiety to unionise the workers must be seen in the larger context of 
government-trade union collaboration in the Social Contract. 

In effect what the government says to the workers in the Social Contract is: 
'we are in a time of great economic crisis, with increasing inflation and 
galloping unemployment. The only way we are going to solve the problem is 
by keeping wages down. But we can do this only with your agreement to put 
up with hardships. So if you agree not to use your power of collective action 
(the only power you really have to improve your conditions) we will in turn see 
that you are protected from the employers taking advantage of your restraint. 
We will, in return for your abandoning the right to collective bargaining, give 
you statutory safeguards to keep the employers at bay.' Hence the 
Employment Protection Act 1975, the Trade Union and Labour Relations Acts 
of 1974 and 1976, the Sex Discrimination Act 1975, the Health and Safety at 
Work Act 1974 and the Equal Pay Act 1970 (enforced in 1975). And, more 
recently, Michael Foot, Leader of the House of Commons, has inveighed 
against the judiciary for its apparent anti-union bias. 'If the freedom of the 
people of this country - and especially the rights of trade unionists - had been 
left to the good sense and fairmindedness of judges, we would have precious 
few freedoms in this country.' 

The Grunwick dispute, if the other Asians strikes are anything to go by, 
threatens to blow a hole, however small, in the Social Contract, and in the 
circumstances (of the rank and file of' the working class clearly jibbing at a 
further extension of the Social Contract), one swallow could easily make a 
summer! To bring the dispute within the Social Contract framework it is 
necessary to unionise the Asian strikers. But to unionise a black workforce, it 
is first necessary to take a stand against racial discrimination. It is necessary 
to speak to the workers' first and overwhelming 'disability'. 'The strike,' said 
Mrs Desai, 'is not so much about pay, it is a strike about human dignity.' 
Hence, if the unions are to win the confidence of the strikers, and of black 
workers in general, they have to take an unequivocal stand against the 
employer's racist practices. Besides, it is the very fact of colour that has, as 
so many times before, lent a political dimension to the struggle of the 
Grunwick strikers - and the unions, as so many times before, are anxious to 
keep that dimension out, particularly in view of the Social Contract. 
Additionally, in the overall strategy of the state, the management of racism in 
employment has, since the strikes of 1972-74, been handed over to the 
trades unions (and not to the Community Relations Commission). 
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Now that the state has decided that the social and political cost of racism has 
begun - in the objective circumstances - to outweigh its economic profitability 
(see 'Race, Class and the State'), the unions are equally anxious to contribute 
to that effort. 

In fact as far back as the TUC Conference in September 1976, APEX General 
Secretary, Roy Grantham, spoke about the Grunwick dispute in the context of 
the Government White Paper on Racial Discrimination, which heralded the 
Race Relations Act. The Act itself, passed in November 1976, is very 
concerned with employment and in fact extends the application of the new 
employment laws' complaints procedures to the area of racial discrimination. 
This Act, unlike previous race relations acts, has full union backing. 

This support for the new legislation has been accompanied by increased 
interest and concern about race relations within the trade union bureaucracies 
since the 1972-4 period of disputes. After the Mansfield Hosiery strike there 
followed a whole spate of strikes throughout the East Midlands involving 
Asian workers in dispute not only with management, but usually with the 
union and fellow white workers too. Strike committees of different factories 
supported each other, workers were learning from the examples set in 
neighbouring cities, local black communities supported the strikers, there was 
serious debate about the need to set up black trades unions. It is since then 
that we find proposals for special training on shop steward courses, the 
establishment of race relations departments in national unions and the TUC 
and the production of a TUC model equal opportunity clause for contracts. 
And, more recently, a government race relations employment advisory group 
has been set up on which the TUC and ACAS, as well as the Confederation of 
British Industry and the Commission for Racial Equality, will be represented. 

But the management of racism in employment is not the only thing that has 
been left to the unions' care. They have also been entrusted with the task of 
selling the Employment Protection Act to the workforce as a whole. The 
Grunwick dispute encompasses both these functions. � What we have, 
therefore, is not a`change of heart' but a change of tactics - to ordain, 
legitimise and continue the joint strategies of the state and union leaders 
against the working class - through the Social Contract. 

Notes �[1.] Under the 1953 Post Office Act, which prohibits 'interference with 
the mail'.	
  


